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Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Sat, Dec 3, 2022 at 10:06 AM
To: info@journal-ems.com

Dear Editor in Chief,
European Modern Studies (EMS) Journal

Herewith I submit an Original Research Paper entitled “The Challenge and Opportunity to Fulfill Street Children’s Human Rights in
Surabaya City Indonesia" for consideration to be published in  European Modern Studies (EMS) Journal. 

Thank you,
Raden Roro Nanik

3 attachments

Title Page.docx
15K

Cover Page.docx
15K

Manuscript.docx
29K

Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Sat, Dec 3, 2022 at 10:07 AM
To: iman purba <imanpurba@unesa.ac.id>, Sarmini Sarmini <sarmini@unesa.ac.id>, alifia.19081@mhs.unesa.ac.id, irma.19015@mhs.unesa.ac.id

[Quoted text hidden]

3 attachments

Title Page.docx
15K

Cover Page.docx
15K

Manuscript.docx
29K

Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com> Mon, Dec 5, 2022 at 5:12 PM
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Rr. Nanik Setyowati,
Thank you for your interest in our journal.
We have received your manuscript and we will be reviewing it shortly. 
Please note that if the article is accepted, you will be charged a 80$ publication fee.

Best regards,
Valeriya Romina (LinkedIn)
Editor
European Modern Studies Journal
www.journal-ems.com 

сб, 3 дек. 2022 г. в 05:06, Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>:
[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Mon, Dec 5, 2022 at 6:39 PM
To: "Helmi109@gmail" <helmi109@gmail.com>

Sent from my Galaxy
[Quoted text hidden]
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Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Mon, Dec 5, 2022 at 6:50 PM
To: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>

Dear,
Thank you, I will wait for further information from you, and I agree to pay 80 SGD when my manuscript is accepted.

Best Reards

Raden Roro. Nanik Setyowati
[Quoted text hidden]

Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Mon, Dec 5, 2022 at 7:06 PM
To: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>

Dear,

I apologize for the mistype,
Revised my email so we will pay 80$ and not 80 SGD

Best Regards

Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati
[Quoted text hidden]

Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com> Wed, Dec 14, 2022 at 11:22 PM
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Rr. Nanik Setyowati,
Thank you for your submission.
We are pleased to inform you that your article entitled "The Challenge and Opportunity to Fulfill Street Children’s Human Rights in Surabaya
City Indonesia" has been successfully reviewed and accepted for publication in VOL 6, NO 5 (2022) of European Modern Studies Journal, which
will be released by the end of December, 2022. 
The publishing fee is $80. You can make payment using your credit/debit card or Google/Apple Pay on our website: https://journal-ems.
com/index.php/emsj/author-fee
Please send us the payment confirmation before December 19.
If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me.
I look forward to hearing from you soon.

Best regards,
Valeriya Romina (LinkedIn)
Editor
European Modern Studies Journal
www.journal-ems.com 

сб, 3 дек. 2022 г. в 05:06, Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>:
Dear Editor in Chief,
[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 6:48 AM
To: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>

Thank you for your infofmation

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/14/22 11:23 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 6:49 AM
To: imanpurba@unesa.ac.id

https://journal-ems.com/index.php/emsj/author-fee
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Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/14/22 11:23 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 6:49 AM
To: "Helmi109@gmail" <helmi109@gmail.com>

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/14/22 11:23 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 6:53 AM
To: sarmini@unesa.ac.id

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/14/22 11:23 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 9:16 AM
To: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>

Dear Editor in Chief,
The following is attached proof of payment for the submission fee for:
Original Research Paper entitled “The Challenge and Opportunity to Fulfill Street Children's Human Rights in Surabaya City Indonesia"
by Rr. Nanik Setyowati.

The payment using HSBC credit card in the name of Ahmad Helmi with number 4034 0900 0164 4478
Thank you

Rr. Nanik Setyowati
[Quoted text hidden]
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Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 9:53 AM
To: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
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Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

9:16 AM (30 minutes ago)

to Journal

Dear Editor in Chief,
The following is attached proof of payment for the submission fee for:
Original Research Paper entitled “The Challenge and Opportunity to Fulfill Street Children's Human Rights in Surabaya City Indonesia"
by Rr. Nanik Setyowati.

The payment using HSBC credit card in the name of Ahmad Helmi with number 4034 0900 0164 4478
Thank you

Rr. Nanik Setyowati

[Quoted text hidden]

Gmail - Your payment WFP-BTN-5351081-639a7f74eabad at verification.pdf
125K

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 1:34 PM
To: irma.19015@mhs.unesa.ac.id

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/14/22 11:23 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 4:01 PM
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Rr. Nanik Setyowati,
Your payment arrived safely. 
I will send the PDF proof of your article for your consideration as soon as possible.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Best regards,
Valeriya Romina (LinkedIn)
Editor
European Modern Studies Journal
www.journal-ems.com 

чт, 15 дек. 2022 г. в 04:54, Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>:
[Quoted text hidden]

Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com> Fri, Dec 23, 2022 at 5:46 PM
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Rr. Nanik Setyowati,
Your payment arrived safely. 
I will send the PDF proof of your article for your consideration as soon as possible.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Best regards,
Valeriya Romina (LinkedIn)
Editor
European Modern Studies Journal
www.journal-ems.com 
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чт, 15 дек. 2022 г. в 04:54, Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>:
[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Fri, Dec 23, 2022 at 6:19 PM
To: imanpurba@unesa.ac.id

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/23/22 5:47 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com> Wed, Dec 28, 2022 at 4:10 PM
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Rr. Nanik Setyowati,
Attached is the file for your reference. Check it carefully, and if any corrections are needed, make them directly in the .doc file and send it to the
editorial office within 72 hours. Please fix the annotation highlighted in yellow.
I look forward to hearing from you soon.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Best regards,
Valeriya Romina (LinkedIn)
Editor
European Modern Studies Journal
www.journal-ems.com 

пт, 23 дек. 2022 г. в 12:46, Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>:
[Quoted text hidden]

19 Setyowati et al., pp. 165-174 naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id.docx
106K

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Wed, Dec 28, 2022 at 5:04 PM
To: imanpurba@unesa.ac.id

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/28/22 4:10 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

19 Setyowati et al., pp. 165-174 naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id.docx
106K

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Wed, Dec 28, 2022 at 5:07 PM
To: riamalulidarahmawati@gmail.com
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Sent from my Galaxy
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From: Journal EMS <info@journal-ems.com>
Date: 12/28/22 4:10 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>
Subject: Re: Submission Manuscript - Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati - 3 Dec 2022

[Quoted text hidden]

19 Setyowati et al., pp. 165-174 naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id.docx
106K

mailto:info@journal-ems.com
mailto:naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=4f9b257833&view=att&th=1855833b8535535a&attid=0.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw

